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Pullman Journey To The City of Prophet Mohamed (PBUH) 



C  
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HOTEL INTRODUCTION 

 

PULLMAN ROOMS & SUITES 

 

PULLMAN RESTAURANTS 



      HOTEL 
 INTRODUCTION 

5 Star Luxury Services in 836 
Pullman Rooms & Suites, 
and 4 International Pullman 
Restaurants. 529 in-door car 
parking spaces enable 
nomads to control their 
journey. Wireless Internet is 
complementary! 



6 7 P U L L m a n h o t e L s . c o m  t h e  P U L L m a n  maGaZIne 

      HOTEL 
 
          LOCATION 

Located near the Salam Gate of The Mosque of Prophet Mohamed (PBUH). Ladies gate is on 5 minutes walk.  

Shuttle bus service to Ladies Gate is available for every prayer & Ziyarah timing! 
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      PULLMAN 
               HUB 

24 hours reception at the 
warm Pullman Hub awaits 
the global nomads 
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      PULLMAN 
   ROOMS & SUITES 

Spacious & elegant 836 
Pullman Rooms & Suites are 
tailor-made for global 
nomads. Complementary 
Wireless Internet, and 
modern facilities keep 
ensure a seamless stay. 

HONEYMOON PARADISE 

LEAVE THE MATERIAL WORLD BEHIND A SPIRITUAL RETREAT LIKE NO OTHER 

INTER-CONNECTING ROOMS 

COMFORT YOUR EYES & SOUL 

IMMERSE IN SPIRITUAL SETTING LIKE NEVER BEFORE 
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      PULLMAN 
 
    EXECUTIVE SUITE 

With Haram View 
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      PULLMAN 
  JUNIOR SUITE 

With Haram View 
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      PULLMAN 
  DELUXE ROOM 

King With Haram View 
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      PULLMAN 
  DELUXE ROOM 

Twin With Haram View 
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      PULLMAN 
 
INTER-CONNECTING 

Rooms & Suites 
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      PULLMAN 
 
CLASSIC TRIPPLE ROOM 
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      PULLMAN 
 
     CLASSIC QUAD ROOM 
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     PULLMAN 
        RESTAURANTS 

A choice of four 
International Restaurants, 
and a lobby café enable our 
nomads to taste the best of 
handpicked International 
cuisine experience.  

SPECIAL KIDS MENU AVAILABLE 

FLAIR OF DATES, COFFEE AND MUCH MORE 

A TREAT FOR TASTE-BUDS & SOUL 

IDEAL FOR BUSINESS & LEISURE 

AN AFFAIR OF ALL DAY DINNING 
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      THE HORIZON 
 
  ROOFTOP RESTAURANT 

All-Day Dinning 
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      AL MANDARA 
 
                      RESTAURANT 

All-Day Dinning 
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  ACCACIA 
 
                      RESTAURANT 

     All-Day Dinning 
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      ATTRIUM 
 
                                        Café  

Lobby Lounge 
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    AL-DIWAN 
 
                      RESTAURANT  

All-Day Dinning 
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SHUTTLE BUS 
 
SERVICE TO LADIES GATE 

After every half an hour 
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Pullman Journey To The City of Prophet Mohamed (PBUH) 


